
SB 26: Requires that students in every grade from kindergarten through grade 12 receive at 
least half of semester, or equivalent of half of semester, of instruction in civics


SB 52: LGBTQ+ Student Success


SB 55: Directs Office of School Facilities to administer statewide facilities assessment program


SB 328: Requires districts to include suspension/expulsion data in reports


SB 513: Requires student to demonstrate proficiency in civics in order to receive high school 
diploma.


SB 552: Directs Department of Education to convene advisory group to study media program 
standards developed by State Board of Education and to report results of study to interim 
committee of Legislative Assembly related to education


SB 580: Amends definition of "employment relations" to include class size and caseload limits 
as mandatory collective bargaining subjects for school districts.


SB 594: Monitoring software used in education


SB 595: Standards for use of monitoring software in education 


SB 596: “Too young to test” bill


SB 597: High school graduation and standardized testing v1


SB 598: High school graduation and standardized testing v2


SB 599: High school graduation and standardized testing v3


SB 600: Audit of the use of standardized assessments


SB 609: Task force for research on learning


SB 617: African American history and literature


SB 624: Review of public charter schools


SB 678: Allows parents to excuse students from state assessments by completing form; eases 
opt out process


SB 679: Allows class size as part of collective bargaining


SB 683: Anti racism curriculum


SB 744: Directs Department of Education to review state requirements for high school diploma 
and to report results of review to interim committees of Legislative Assembly related to 
education and to State Board of Education


HB 2001: Requires school district that is making reductions in educator staff positions to retain 
teacher with less seniority if teacher has more merit and if retention of teacher is necessary to 
maintain school district's diversity ratio 
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HB 2051: Increases formula weight for students in poverty families for purposes of State 
School Fund distributions.


HB 2056: Language Equity 


HB 2052: Requires school district to allow students to wear Native American items of cultural 
significance at public school events, including high school graduation.


HB 2195: Prohibits student from enrolling in virtual public charter school located in school 
district in which student is not resident if student's resident school district or education service 
district offers appropriate online instruction.


HB 2368: Establishes pilot program using trauma informed approaches to education, health 
services, and intervention strategies


HB 2369: Directs ODE to establish statewide mental and behavioral healthcare plan for 
students. 


HB 2406: Expands types of pesticide that may not be included in school list of low-impact 
pesticides for use in integrated pest management plan.


HB 2408: Directs ODE to conduct study on meeting students’ behavioral health needs


HB 2501: Increases formula weight for students in poverty for State School Fund distribution


HB 2504: Establishes disciplinary mediators in school districts


HB 2589: Allows students who have earned a certain score on GED to bypass placement test 
and developmental education requirements upon entering public institutions of higher ed.


HB 2631: Prescribes notification requirements for school district upon receipt of report of act of 
harassment, intimidation, bullying or cyberbullying.


HB 2697: Requires education provider to prohibit use or display of any symbols of hate on 
school property or in education program.


HB 2817: Allows students in GED programs to participate in interscholastic activities


HB 3041: Removes "gender identity" from definition of "sexual orientation" in ORS 174.100 
and creates standalone definition of "gender identity" in ORS 174.100.


HB 3130 Provides that certain substitute teachers are considered employees of school district 
and are eligible for retirement benefits and health benefit plans
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